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Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 071596
Date 21 July 2015

Freedom of Information Requests

Request:
Under the Freedom of Information Act I would like the following information in
whatever format you see fit:

1. How many FOIs have you received in the last 5 years?
Last 5 Financial Years:
2010/11 = 680
2011/12 = 883
2012/13 = 853
2013/14 = 1051
2014/15 = 1245

2. How many have you received each moth for the last 12 months?
Financial Year 2014/15
April = 118
May = 114
June = 94
July = 103
August = 105
September = 92
October = 102
November = 104
December = 74
January = 113
February = 118
March = 108

3. How much officer time (roughly) does this take up
This information not recorded

4. Do you know how much this has cost the Council
This information not recorded

5. How many are from local residents and how many are from students and
businesses (if known)
We do not record the information in the format you have requested.


