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Social Care

Request:

Please treat this email as a Freedom of Information request.

1. How many people currently access support for a) residential and b) non-
residential social care from your local authority?
a) 1078
b) 2148

2. How many people accessed support for a) residential and b) non-residential
social care from your local authority between 31 March 2013 and 31 March
2014?
a) 1619
b) 3154

3 How many people in receipt of a War Disablement Pension currently access
support for a) residential and b) non-residential social care from your local
authority?
Information not held.

4 How many people in receipt of a War Disablement Pension accessed support
for a) residential and b) non-residential social care from your local authority
between 31 March 2013 and 31 March 2014?
Information not held.

5 How many people in receipt of Armed Forces Compensation Scheme
Guaranteed Income Payments currently access support for a) residential and b)
non-residential social care from your local authority?
Information not held.

6 How many people in receipt of Armed Forces Compensation Scheme
Guaranteed Income Payments accessed support for a) residential and b) non-
residential social care from your local authority between 31 March 2013 and 31
March 2014?
Information not held.


