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18 June 2015

Housing Waiting List and Disabled People

Request:

Please find below a number of questions relating to housing waiting lists and
disabled people to be considered under the Freedom of Information Act.

Please answer each question in respect to the area covered by your local authority.

1.

What was the total number of households on your local authority housing
waiting list on:

01 April 2011 — 13,752

01 April 2012 — 9,346

01 April 2013 — 9,855

01 April 2014 — 9,917

01 April 2015 -10,472

®opoTp

How many households on your local authority housing waiting list included at
least one disabled person on:

a. 01 April 2011

b. 01 April 2012

c. 01 April 2013

d. 01 April 2014

e. 01 April 2015

We do not hold the information in the detail you have requested.

On 01 April 2015, what was the longest that a household including at least one
disabled person had been on your housing waiting list?
We do not hold the information in the detail you have requested.

On 01 April 2015, what was the longest that any household had been on your
housing waiting list?
We do not hold the information in the detail you have requested.



