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Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 041522
Date 6 April 2015 2015

Social Engineering by Children’s Social Services to meet
targets and acquire bonuses in the best interests of the
child

Request:
Because we cannot set a date of the “second trigger” we are asking for this request
to go back 10 years.

1. We are asking how many parents have been placed on child protection for
‘emotional harm” for:-

a) Seeking advice

b) Seeking help (financial or asking for a service)

c) Seeking medical attention or advice (NHS now alert social services)

d) Reporting abuse

i) Sexual

ii) Psychical

iii) Emotional

The answer to the above question is nil as parents are not placed on child protection.

2. How many times did your authority recommend the child be placed with the
person or family that had concerns raised against them, as per Q1 (placed with the
un-protective parent)

We do not record this information therefore we are unable to answer your above
question.

3. And following Q2 how many children were placed within:-

a) Your authorities jurisdiction

b) Another authorities jurisdiction

We do not record this information therefore we are unable to answer your above
question.

4. Following Q3, How many concerns were raised by authorities or agencies
against the un-protective parent that were previously raised (or similar concerns) in
Q1 by the protective parent(s)

We do not record this information therefore we are unable to answer your above
question.
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5. Following Q4, How many children were then placed for adoption or fostering.
We do not record this information therefore we are unable to answer your above
question.

6. Following Q5, How much does the authority / social worker receive for
a) Placing a child for adoption - Nil
b) Placing a child in foster care - Nil

7. What are the ongoing costs received by central government to local
government social workers / foster careers etc. for

a) Children adopted - Nil

b) Children in foster care - Nil



