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Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 0315147

Date 27 March 2015
Number of Teachers
Request:

1) For the total number of Full Time Equivalent (FTE) teachers in Wolverhampton as
of the school workforce census in i) November 2013 ii) November 2014.

| can confirm that we hold this information. The information is exempt under Section
21 of the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA), because the information is accessible
to you, as it is already in the public domain. Please see the link below:
https://www.gov.uk/government/collections/statistics-school-workforce#history

2) For the number of FTE teachers with QTS in Wolverhampton as of the school
workforce census in i) November 2013 ii) November 2014.

| can confirm that we hold this information. The information is exempt under Section
21 of the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA), because the information is accessible
to you, as it is already in the public domain. Please see the link below:
https://www.gov.uk/government/collections/statistics-school-workforce#history

3) For the total number of FTE specialist a) art b) history c) English d) PE e) drama
teachers in secondary-phase schools in Wolverhampton that were teaching
mathematics as of the school workforce census in i) January 2010 ii) November
2010 iii) November 2013 ii) November 2014.

We do not hold this information. You will have to approach each individual school for
their response.

4) For the total number of FTE specialist a) art b) history ¢) English d) PE e) drama
teachers in secondary-phase schools in Wolverhampton that were teaching physics
as of the school workforce census in i) January 2010 ii) November 2010 iii)
November 2013 ii) November 2014.

We do not hold this information. You will have to approach each individual school for
their response.
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