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Response to Request for Information 

 
Reference FOI 0315118 
Date 24 March 2015 
 

Troubled Families Programme 

 
Request: 
(1) The ethnic breakdown of families you have identified for inclusion in the troubled 
families programme. 
 

Please find below the ethnic breakdown of families identified and 
successfully turned around on the Families in Focus programme in 
Wolverhampton: 

Ethnicity Number of Families 

White 551 

Mixed 41 

Asian 142 

Black 56 

Other 20 

 
 
(2) The breakdown of religion or belief of families you have identified for inclusion in 
the troubled families programme. 
 

For the purposes and requirements of the Troubled Families programme 
this information was not recorded on our database therefore we do not 
hold this information. 

 
(3) The breakdown of number of children in families you have identified for inclusion 
in the troubled families programme. 

For the purposes and requirements of the Troubled Families programme 
this information was not recorded on our database therefore we do not 
hold this information. 
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(4) How many families you have identified for inclusion in the troubled families 
programme are 'single-parent' households. 
 

For the purposes and requirements of the Troubled Families programme 
this information was not recorded on our database therefore we do not 
hold this information. 

 

 


