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Response to Request for Information 

 
Reference FOI 0115149 
Date 26 February 2015 
 

Population, treatment centres and kinship carers 

 
Request: 

1. What is the population size of Wolverhampton?  
http://www.wolverhamptoninprofile.org.uk 

2. How many residents received some form of drug or alcohol treatment in the last 
12 months? 
This information is not held by the Council, Recovery Near You, Pitt 
Street, Wolverhampton, WV3 0NF, the provider, holds information on 
service users.  

 
3. How many known carers of drug or alcohol users are there?  

This information is not held by the Council, Recovery Near You, Pitt 
Street, Wolverhampton, WV3 0NF, the provider, holds information on 
service users.  

 
4. How many kinship carers* live in  Wolverhampton? 

 
46 
 
*This request defines kinship carers as a family relative to the child, who is not 
the child’s parents. For example, grandparent, aunts and uncles, siblings and 
cousins, as well as close friends of the family. 

5.     Of the total number of kinship carers, how many are kinship carers due to 
parental drug or alcohol use?  

        13  

6.     How many children are looked after by a kinship carer due to parental drug or 
alcohol use? 

 
        52 
 

http://www.wolverhamptoninprofile.org.uk/

