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Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 003638
Date 4 June 2019

Temporary Accommodation

Request:

I would like to request:
1. The current list of approved suppliers of temporary accommodation that the

council will use to procure from.
We operate a flexible model to meet temporary housing needs.

If the council do not hold a list of approved suppliers I would like to request:
2. The full list of suppliers of temporary accommodation that was procured from in

the financial year 2018-19. If data for 2018-19 is not yet available, then this
should be provided for 2017-18.
We have two contracted providers – P3 for single persons temporary
accommodation and the Haven for refuge provision. We also use Local
authority stock as temporary accommodation managed by the council’s
housing ALMO, Wolverhampton Homes.

If the Council uses contractors to manage their own stock of Temporary
Accommodation I would like to request:
3. The current list of approved contractors used to manage temporary

accommodation that the council will use to procure from.
See our response above.

If the council do not hold a list of approved contractors I would like to request:
4. The full list of contractors used to manage temporary accommodation that was

procured from in the financial year 2018

For suppliers of temporary accommodation, I would like to request:
5. For the financial year 2018/19 the total actual spend with each supplier.

Single persons accommodation - £861,000
Refuge- £761,000

6. For the financial year 2017/18 the total actual spend with each supplier.
Single persons accommodation - £1,100,000
Refuge- £884,000
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7. For the financial year 2016/17 the total actual spend with each supplier.
Single persons accommodation - £932,000
Refuge - £828,000

If data is not available for 2018/19 then I would request the most recent three years
when data is available.

For contractors who are used to manage the council’s own supply of temporary
accommodation, I would like to request:
8. For the financial year 2018/19 the total actual spend with each contractor.

N/A
9. For the financial year 2017/18 the total actual spend with each contractor.

N/A
10. For the financial year 2016/17 the total actual spend with each contractor.

N/A


