
[NOT PROTECTIVELY MARKED] 

 

 

 

 

Response to Request for Information 

 
Reference FOI 003602 
Date 23 May 2019 
 

Spend on placing cover teachers and supply teachers 

 
Request: 
 
1. I need to find out how much Wolverhampton City Council spends on placing 

cover teachers and supply teachers each year at its LA Maintained Schools, 
expenditure items E02 & E26.  

 
2. May I please request that you provide me with your annual spend on agency 

teachers and supply teachers for each year from 2003 up to, and including, 
2018? 

 
3. Would it also be possible to have the spend data split into two columns, E02 

and E26. 
 
4. If possible, I would also like to request a schedule of schools' individual annual 

payments to supply teaching agencies. 
 
Please find attached response to this request. 
 
The attached provides a schedule of all LA maintained schools and their expenditure 
on CFR items E02 (Supply teaching staff), and E26 (Agency Supply Teaching Staff) 
for each year from 2010-11 to 2018-19. The LA no longer hold records prior to this 
date. 
 
Please note that with reference to the attached table, some of the information is 
missing from The Orchard Centre, The Braybrook Centre and Midpoint Centre.   
 
Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 places two duties on public 
authorities.  Unless exemptions apply, the first duty at: 
 

• Section 1(1) (a) is to confirm or deny whether the information specified in a 
request is held.  
  

• The second duty at Section 1(1)(b) is to disclose information that has been 
confirmed as being held. 

 
In respect of this missing information, it has been established after careful 
consideration that the Council does not hold this information as the budgets were 
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delegated to the 3 schools in question.  There was no requirement from the schools 
to report on how the money was spent, therefore the information is not held. 

 
Consequently, we are unable to provide any information relating to the above, and 
are informing you as required by Section 1(1) (a) of the Act, that states:  
 
"Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled to be 
informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the 
description specified in the request".  
 
 
 
 



School E02 E26 E02 E26 E02 E26 E02 E26 E02 E26 E02 E26 E02 E06 E02 E06 E02 E06

Ashmore Park Nursery £0.00 £1,000.92 £0.00 £0.00 £647.91 £12,125.94 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00

Bantock Primary £0.00 £8,919.58 £0.00 £17,432.41 £0.00 £27,378.79 £0.00 £41,507.85 £0.00 £74,509.07 £3,734.82 £52,359.90 £6,651.77 £3,389.11 £12,760.79 £0.00 £28,623.92 £264.00

Bilston CE Primary £0.00 £718.40 £0.00 £1,910.70 £0.00 £15,511.04 £611.61 £5,774.50 -£6,053.79 £3,497.99 £22,968.30 £6,377.00 £35,606.17 £3,091.50 £33,994.63 £1,974.20 £31,786.36 £2,741.95

Bilston Nursery £0.00 £4,843.07 £0.00 £35,226.18 £0.00 £11,654.76 £0.00 £22,109.47 £437.11 £38,580.03 £982.69 £17,399.21 -£293.74 £6,287.19 -£288.26 £1,495.73 £0.00 £5,456.31

Bushbury Hill Primary £0.00 £10,795.60 £5,698.41 £22,510.08 £989.93 £17,692.10 £522.86 £29,103.30 £4,924.31 £46,529.03 £6,624.39 £49,452.19 £10,149.16 £42,359.10 £10,388.46 £20,773.55 £4,482.35 £45,809.00

Bushbury Nursery £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £392.25 £0.00 £4,732.47 £0.00 £15,761.32 £0.00 £10,856.77 £1,917.38 £2,601.72 £3,495.83 £7,843.57 £11,587.00 £1,549.85 £14,771.69 £0.00

Castlecroft Primary £0.00 £21,305.78 £10,376.98 £36,777.74 £0.00 £24,031.50 £4,166.55 £15,130.01 £12,609.21 £18,586.72 £28,761.06 £10,215.66 £30,911.84 £1,545.00 £48,200.99 £0.00 £64,906.73 £0.00

Christ Church Inf (TW) £0.00 £8,609.20 £19,103.80 £7,028.05 £17,875.99 £0.00 £22,040.67 £0.00 £19,314.84 £0.00 £37,961.48 £0.00 £24,381.21 £0.00 £22,662.62 £0.00 £14,646.60 £0.00

Christ Church Jr School £0.00 £17,965.86 £0.00 £15,855.65 £1,758.00 £72,998.84 £2,941.06 £35,830.85 £10,021.96 £25,201.32 £9,693.24 £8,723.00 £4,133.64 £17,430.20 £11,511.29 £16,735.02 £12,124.05 £15,142.58

Claregate Primary £0.00 £50,960.58 £0.00 £49,476.13 £0.00 £58,395.28 £9,557.25 £66,176.64 £5,311.62 £45,744.77 £35,205.49 £31,345.70 £31,623.11 £5,983.00 £50,641.45 £1,290.45 £39,985.55 £4,310.75

Colton Hills £0.00 £276,989.93 £0.00 £261,595.45 £4,587.69 £259,981.89 £1,679.93 £134,638.31 £8,329.55 £236,094.90 £8,770.87 £164,805.02 £15,682.51 £95,200.35 £16,608.07 £47,531.69 £24,436.30 £307,828.77

Dovecotes Primary £0.00 £107,091.49 £34,360.35 £153,926.04 £58,306.06 £32,973.90 £45,956.95 £19,679.28 £10,782.61 £40,250.69 £24,965.46 £42,767.31 £20,435.02 £26,194.02 £19,531.26 £9,773.87 £17,897.46 £21,472.62

Eastfield Nursery £0.00 £1,149.75 £0.00 £22,480.82 £0.00 £494.45 £0.00 £2,043.56 £0.00 £10,506.39 £0.00 £9,433.80 £0.00 £4,974.87 £0.00 £230.00 £0.00 £0.00

Eastfield Primary £0.00 £84,536.73 £0.00 £50,583.04 £0.00 £24,582.93 £0.00 £27,091.96 £1,733.94 £16,197.00 £4,605.35 £155.00 £200.00 £0.00 £3,778.18 £0.00 £6,612.45 £0.00

Fallings Park Primary £0.00 £40,028.22 £2,307.88 £22,685.63 £9,605.52 £10,373.82 £19,059.58 £41,046.89 £15,476.79 £8,134.00 £21,220.74 £26,410.00 £20,834.90 £8,757.87 £37,997.03 £2,204.77 £37,010.51 £8,824.86

Graiseley Primary £7,972.69 £40,383.55 £3,260.61 £14,399.75 £8,320.45 £38,507.40 £14,203.64 £41,020.53 £20,009.80 £7,073.39 £18,308.90 £23,580.19 £15,516.09 £13,287.46 £4,744.65 £12,460.40 £20,391.33 £3,964.50

Green Park Special £0.00 £126,102.19 £0.00 £104,488.76 £74,341.51 £135,061.32 £100,305.71 £85,129.07 £4,908.04 £89,200.62 £12,284.27 £23,150.53 £21,622.95 £50,298.50 £18,269.21 £37,258.75 £22,310.97 £27,228.55

Holy Trinity Primary £0.00 £16,201.14 £0.00 £21,884.35 £0.00 £19,946.31 £1,506.07 £358.00 £718.95 £4,867.00 £824.98 £11,578.14 £1,368.92 £7,297.13 £6,313.47 £13,786.64 £2,490.92 £14,984.43

Lanesfield Primary £0.00 £21,655.30 £0.00 £24,504.50 £0.00 £5,991.00 £0.00 £36,804.58 £19,107.78 £18,683.45 £17,277.33 £13,951.85 £13,630.58 £24,824.90 £13,611.09 £8,826.67 £9,060.04 £9,690.46

Long Knowle Primary £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £12,709.26 £0.00 £22,904.00 £1,191.46 £25,405.90 £29,636.53 £40,188.44 £16,565.96 £13,487.17 £13,506.27 £15,351.58 £22,357.78 £5,713.34 £17,993.81 £3,591.46

Low Hill Nursery £0.00 £6,802.25 £0.00 £9,319.93 £647.91 £12,125.94 £0.00 £5,643.82 £6,102.28 £6,753.46 £2,953.65 £29,466.39 £0.00 £9,950.91 £3,859.63 £12,964.45 £5,693.41 £18,958.00

Loxdale Primary School £0.00 £21,393.00 £0.00 £33,252.45 £0.00 £39,289.83 £150.00 £58,096.04 £470.01 £31,105.00 £649.59 £10,608.00 £1,540.00 £9,577.00 £10,997.71 £3,896.50 £12,252.12 £11,682.45

Merridale Primary School £0.00 £2,680.00 £0.00 £2,868.50 £0.00 £1,080.10 £0.00 £24,113.90 £5,772.12 £28,499.18 £11,720.59 £13,138.38 £9,513.56 £17,152.78 £22,220.85 £18,822.35 £13,496.64 £21,803.00

Midpoint Centre £0.00 £127,265.75 £0.00 £176,439.63 £0.00 £69,585.30 £0.00 £90,887.54 £0.00 £110,412.70 £929.98 £108,430.14

Oak Meadow Primary £0.00 £0.00 £13,441.54 £0.00 £14,448.35 £5,915.71 £20,231.75 £289.04 £23,399.14 £1,666.32 £21,107.52 £276.50 £26,008.73 £0.00 £9,945.86 £843.00 £15,035.19 £3,408.00

Penn Fields Special £0.00 £65,309.67 £0.00 £56,376.59 £0.00 £38,727.95 £2,396.54 £32,382.88 £4,612.30 £17,654.49 £4,413.15 £14,281.40 £2,083.68 £38,692.00 £7,069.57 £36,317.59 £18,718.19 £30,309.42

Penn Hall Special £0.00 £2,770.00 £1,229.67 £52,110.79 £0.00 £89,019.76 £0.00 £63,507.49 £148.71 £98,702.94 £149.69 £60,975.21 £3,801.16 £74,948.90 £6,175.64 £21,713.00 £6,777.20 £48,775.14

Phoenix Nursery £0.00 £930.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £2,116.00 £89.03 £8,223.52 £11,133.10 £17,047.30 £1,170.75 £5,140.51 £0.00 £18,113.82 £0.00 £12,926.71

Rakegate Primary £0.00 £36,254.34 £0.00 £75,860.15 £0.00 £39,845.50 £0.00 £74,826.10 £2,740.46 £109,459.40 £7,131.19 £82,629.14 £13,721.91 £26,293.04 £20,086.40 £29,937.50 £14,874.69 £56,991.00

Spring Vale Primary £0.00 £0.00 £11,596.63 £0.00 £11,568.27 £450.00 £7,969.99 £1,842.00 £7,079.24 £11,015.31 £12,423.01 £7,528.08 £10,479.19 £3,171.69 £12,537.23 £2,379.15 £9,680.93 £5,214.00

Springdale Primary £0.00 £62,662.28 £0.00 £85,373.86 £1,224.48 £42,560.30 £204.48 £18,357.31 £8,484.29 £25,504.45 £8,551.48 £1,019.94 £23,740.66 £1,008.24 £27,997.09 £1,635.44 £21,618.61 £4,136.60

St Andrew's CE Primary £0.00 £22,868.58 £0.00 £18,370.63 £0.00 £17,310.81 £0.00 £59,100.43 £7,170.76 £125,193.51 £12,887.01 £68,241.98 £7,645.54 £34,796.72 £5,095.08 £29,592.29 £11,006.39 £40,538.00

St Anthony's RC Primary £0.00 £1,402.67 £14,203.98 £568.00 £15,865.10 £54,131.19 £30,151.69 £23,072.76 £21,894.48 £20,983.15 £32,032.24 £22,942.67 £20,802.61 £5,293.87 £14,888.16 £7,624.70 £17,319.48 £17,218.00

St Luke's Primary £0.00 £12,159.00 £9,244.22 £981.00 £0.00 £0.00 £5,550.00 £0.00 £10,302.73 £340.98 £18,036.68 £13,795.52 £23,189.76 £4,427.62 £18,204.05 £0.00 £19,438.16 £49.16

St Matthias School £0.00 £59,103.69 £0.00 £8,959.95 £0.00 £69,173.00 £0.00 £5,552.00 £0.00 £12,935.24 £3,437.84 -£200.00 £3,215.09 £2,490.00 £3,117.01 £335.00 £3,524.14 £6,298.96

St Michael's CE Primary £0.00 £9,934.00 £5,885.65 £25,011.00 £12,312.79 £334.12 £0.00 £1,988.75 £8,517.11 £5,869.80 £16,265.38 £6,540.15 £25,304.57 £10,237.32 £30,762.99 £2,243.36 £41,816.98 £6,044.76

St Patrick's RC Primary £0.00 £31,765.44 £0.00 £57,325.41 £1,557.00 £47,560.66 £8,574.84 £12,837.75 £12,884.25 £18,469.34 £28,810.71 £26,330.02 £24,065.19 £12,479.61 £12,606.48 £3,010.12 £12,516.56 £15,034.00

St Paul's CE Primary £0.00 £0.00 £17,488.96 £1,464.20 £0.00 £0.00 £12,422.30 £369.98 £15,064.65 £0.00 £14,673.36 £0.00 £13,041.70 £0.00 £9,753.00 £0.00 £13,206.24 £0.00

Stow Heath Primary £0.00 £59,830.46 £3,144.92 £77,337.13 £0.00 £72,807.01 £0.00 £79,394.73 £866.81 £101,628.95 £3,071.76 £95,090.74 £12,802.07 £44,781.48 £8,095.10 £94,151.80 £3,053.23 £44,124.20

Stowlawn Primary School £0.00 £6,535.72 £42,176.19 £0.00 £26,265.83 £2,000.00 £40,083.11 £750.00 £18,409.64 £10,017.97 £49,788.14 £9,517.86 £52,290.64 £0.00 £47,272.89 £6,180.43 £47,494.01 £22,125.61

Tettenhall Wood Special £0.00 £94,269.05 £0.00 £27,706.30 £0.00 £124,939.02 £24,818.00 £141,168.13 £28,017.53 £75,815.32 £40,087.79 £94,884.86 £44,005.48 £6,456.00 £44,473.30 £23,144.81 £27,254.67 £16,406.00

The Braybrook Centre £0.00 £118,897.43 £0.00 £101,416.70 £0.00 £25,032.68 £0.00 £29,840.94 £0.00 £53,381.40 £190.44 £70,045.32

The King's School £0.00 £39,199.16 £0.00 £15,588.28 £0.00 £88,010.25 £0.00 £59,278.50 £11,377.18 £128,763.21 £15,696.76 £115,265.60 £15,533.82 £87,703.50 £53,067.32 £68,160.20 £49,741.34 £67,345.00

The Orchard Centre £0.00 £52,958.74 £0.00 £21,750.15 £255.45 £33,914.55 £718.04 £14,220.00 £65,201.79 £65,586.20 £61,294.23 £39,048.63

Uplands Junior School £0.00 £9,950.73 £16,266.07 £16,667.65 £20,246.17 £7,782.28 £24,421.60 £17,519.00 £8,572.98 £20,623.00 £19,900.97 £23,284.00 £30,323.10 £25,929.50 £29,062.67 £9,371.92 £18,537.64 £4,317.00

Warstones Primary £0.00 £11,786.39 £0.00 £15,984.56 £0.00 £50,681.98 £0.00 £24,537.94 £6,964.37 £12,442.45 £14,183.60 £10,466.13 £17,088.00 £12,721.00 £34,810.22 £12,028.50 £71,273.81 £479.00

West Park Primary £0.00 £31,155.89 £21,579.01 £48,708.93 £10,401.69 £21,603.80 £19,197.87 £8,386.36 £17,517.22 £28,754.51 £29,630.83 £25,695.89 £27,615.68 £11,468.30 £40,651.30 £15,469.75 £26,201.08 £6,837.06

Westacre Infant School £0.00 £15,484.28 £0.00 £22,298.54 £0.00 £35,570.06 £0.00 £19,008.91 £8,206.01 £19,555.26 £23,682.14 £0.00 £30,740.70 £0.00 £33,076.50 £0.00 £28,546.44 £0.00

Whitgreave Infant School £0.00 £924.95 £0.00 £17,555.20 £0.00 £40,143.35 £1,166.04 £11,901.26 £3,469.01 £318.00 £7,584.61 £2,695.00 £2,780.56 £4,055.00 £2,897.69 £13,260.35 £28,867.12 £29,910.40

Whitgreave Junior School £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £4,963.97 £0.00 £716.00 £505.48 £3,936.00 £431.89 £3,143.00 £1,795.27 £0.00 £6,634.23 £0.00 £14,907.31 £3,598.75

Wilkinson Primary School £0.00 £3,139.30 £0.00 £0.00 £0.00 £660.00 £0.00 £12,042.70 £0.00 £25,568.25 £1,306.31 £8,062.13 £5,160.43 £21,707.71 £3,343.31 £11,560.01 £6,823.66 £1,441.00

Windsor Nursery £0.00 £2,023.44 £0.00 £262.92 £0.00 £2,180.93 £0.00 £527.00 £0.00 -£0.69 £691.34 £0.00 £207.78 £700.00 £618.52 £0.00 £182.43 £0.00

Wodensfield Primary £0.00 £722.40 £1,815.51 £179.60 £0.00 £0.00 £6,828.41 £179.00 £6,709.01 £1,410.00 £18,415.30 £2,824.00 £30,309.94 £5,010.67 £27,001.99 £9,313.00 £25,195.56 £11,828.72

Wood End Primary School £0.00 £108,287.39 £0.00 £34,285.86 £0.00 £18,130.18 £0.00 £5,204.40 £3,434.11 £14,472.90 £9,698.26 £21,351.79 £8,045.31 £37,660.76 £12,416.28 £8,722.16 £11,729.53 £3,919.00

2018-19 2017-18 2016-17 2015-16 2014-15

This information is not held

This information is not held

This information is not held

2013-14 2012-13 2011-12 2010-11


