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Response to Request for Information 

 
Reference FOI 003479 
Date 17 April 2019 
 

Planning Application 
 
 
Request: 
 
Planning Application Reference 17/01001/FUL 
 
We require the following: 
 
1.  Officer report of the application above, or relevant assessment made. All 

documentation. 
 In response to question 1, Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

places two duties on public authorities.  Unless exemptions apply, the first duty 
at: 

 

• Section 1(1) (a) is to confirm or deny whether the information specified in 
a request is held.  
  

• The second duty at Section 1(1)(b) is to disclose information that has 
been confirmed as being held. 

 
In respect of question 1, it has been established after careful consideration that 
the Council does not hold the above information as no Officer Report was 
written in respect of this application. 
 
Consequently, we are unable to provide any information relating to the above, 
and are informing you as required by Section 1(1) (a) of the Act, that states:  
 
"Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled to 
be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the 
description specified in the request".  
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2. We require all versions of plans submitted as part of the application, those 
orginally consulted on and displayed for public viewing during the consultation 
period and placed online.  
With reference to question 2, your request for information has now been 
considered and the City of Wolverhampton Council is not obliged to supply the 
information you requested for the reasons set out below.  
 
Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 requires City of 
Wolverhampton Council, when refusing to provide such information (because 
the information is exempt) to provide you, the applicant with a notice which: 
 
(a)    states the fact, 
(b)    specifies the exemption in question and  
(c)    states (if that would not otherwise be apparent) why the exemption 

applies:  
 
In relation to your particular request, the following exemption applies:  
 
Section 21 – Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other 
means 
 
We can confirm that the department holds information that you have asked for 
in relation to the above. However, the information is exempt under section 21 of 
the FOI Act because it is reasonably accessible to you, and I am pleased to 
inform you that you can access it on our website via the following link: 
 
http://planningonline.wolverhampton.gov.uk/online-
applications/applicationDetails.do?keyVal=OVJNVZRWHJX00&activeTab=sum
mary 
 
This link provides you with the documents associated with this planning 
application by clicking on ‘Documents’.  You can then redefine your search by 
clicking on ‘show all’ to include location planning, application form, supporting 
documents, discharge conditions, decision, drawings and post decision 
amendments. If you choose ‘Please Choose’ who can then view heritage 
statements, design and access statement, location plan, block plan, proposed 
site plan and street scene drawings. 
 
Section 21(1) of the Freedom of Information Act exempts disclosure of 
information that is reasonably accessible by other means, and the terms of the 
exemption mean that we do not have to consider whether or not it would be in 
the public interest for you to have the information.  
 
You can find out more about Section 21 by reading the extract from the Act, 
available at: http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/section/21 

 
 
 
 
 

https://eur03.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fplanningonline.wolverhampton.gov.uk%2Fonline-applications%2FapplicationDetails.do%3FkeyVal%3DOVJNVZRWHJX00%26activeTab%3Dsummary&data=02%7C01%7CFOI%40wolverhampton.gov.uk%7Ce425dd5aa7ef4b0f1dcd08d6d53b0c43%7C07ebc6c370744387a625b9d918ba4a97%7C0%7C0%7C636930846915924048&sdata=bNr5Tddx3%2FQSvIeWRmmxo6Npo1BRWGLQTmDwAuOi1lI%3D&reserved=0
https://eur03.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fplanningonline.wolverhampton.gov.uk%2Fonline-applications%2FapplicationDetails.do%3FkeyVal%3DOVJNVZRWHJX00%26activeTab%3Dsummary&data=02%7C01%7CFOI%40wolverhampton.gov.uk%7Ce425dd5aa7ef4b0f1dcd08d6d53b0c43%7C07ebc6c370744387a625b9d918ba4a97%7C0%7C0%7C636930846915924048&sdata=bNr5Tddx3%2FQSvIeWRmmxo6Npo1BRWGLQTmDwAuOi1lI%3D&reserved=0
https://eur03.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fplanningonline.wolverhampton.gov.uk%2Fonline-applications%2FapplicationDetails.do%3FkeyVal%3DOVJNVZRWHJX00%26activeTab%3Dsummary&data=02%7C01%7CFOI%40wolverhampton.gov.uk%7Ce425dd5aa7ef4b0f1dcd08d6d53b0c43%7C07ebc6c370744387a625b9d918ba4a97%7C0%7C0%7C636930846915924048&sdata=bNr5Tddx3%2FQSvIeWRmmxo6Npo1BRWGLQTmDwAuOi1lI%3D&reserved=0
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/section/21
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3.  We wish to see notes of the Planning Officers site visit and those visited as 
part of the application.  
In response to question 3, Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
places two duties on public authorities.  Unless exemptions apply, the first duty 
at: 

 

• Section 1(1) (a) is to confirm or deny whether the information specified in 
a request is held.  
  

• The second duty at Section 1(1)(b) is to disclose information that has 
been confirmed as being held. 

 
In respect of question 3, it has been established after careful consideration that 
the Council does not hold the above information. 
 
Consequently, we are unable to provide any information relating to the above, 
and are informing you as required by Section 1(1) (a) of the Act, that states:  
 
"Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled to 
be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the 
description specified in the request".  

 
4.  We require the minutes of the meeting Raj Mal Housing Development Project 

Manager had with owners of Easterling House (ourselves), or other notes and 
any agreement provided. 

 With reference to your above question, we have not provided this information 
as the Council considers that this information meets the definition for personal 
data set out in Section 1(1) of the Data Protection Act 2018 (“DPA”) as: 

  
"data which relate to a living individual who can be identified - (a) from those 
data, or (b) from those data and other information which is in the possession of, 
or is likely to come into the possession of, the data controller and includes any 
expression of opinion about the individual and any indication of the intentions of 
the data controller or any other person in respect of the individual"  

 
The Council thus considers that the requested information is caught by the 
exemption to disclosure contained in Section 40 (1) of the Act, which prohibits 
disclosure of a requester’s own personal information under the Act.  

 
 


